
PRODUCT TYPE: Lounge Chair

ENVIRONMENT: Indoor

MATERIALS: Steel, Wood, Upholstery

DIMENSIONS

W: 95cm / 35½”
D: 140cm / 55”
H: 58cm / 22¾”
Seat height: 36cm / 14”

NET WEIGHT

28,5kg / 63 lbs

COLORS

Check below for exclusive 
WE—KNIT® coverings for WENTZ 
upholstered products.

TECHNICAL DESCRIPTION

Rocking lounge chair with steel 
and wood structure, elastic straps 
and foam. Exclusive WE—KNIT® 
covering. Aluminum and felt 
finishing on the bottom of the base 
to prevent fabric friction against the 
floor. 

CERTIFICATES

US California Tech. Bull. 117

PACKAGING

100 x 145 x 65cm / 39” x 57” x 26”

GROSS WEIGHT

31,5kg / 70 lbs

Canoa  Lounge Chair,
2022

Canoa (“canoe” in Portuguese) is a 
rocking armchair that rocks like the 
sea and evokes the feeling of being 
on the water. Its design is curved 
and sinuous, and its seat has a cozy 
angle, where the body lies almost 
lying down, relaxed and drifting. 
Being completely upholstered, the 
softness is extreme and guarantees 
comfort. The height allows the 
coming and going and the feet, 
close to the ground, give firmness 
to the rhythm — like two oars, they 
give fluidity or pause to rest. There 
is, also, calmness in the waters. The 
upholstery is covered by WE—
KNIT® fabric — 3D fabric made 
from recycled PET bottles collected 
from the oceans.
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CA01
CANOA  LOUNGE CHAIR

MODELS
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UPHOLSTERY OPTIONS

WE—KNIT® 004

COMPOSITION

100% Recycled PET

ABRASION RESISTANCE

100.000 Martindale
Mesh wire pulling: 4 (ISO 1–5)
Colorfastness: 5 (ISO 1–5)

LIGHT RESISTANCE

Lightfastness: 5 (ISO 1–5)

FLAME RESISTANCE

US California Tech. Bull. 117

01
JACQUARD WHITE

02
JACQUARD OFF WHITE

03
JACQUARD SAND

14
JACQUARD CARAMEL

06
JACQUARD CLAY

10
JACQUARD MOSS GREEN

04
JACQUAR GREY

11
JACQUARD NAVY BLUE
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UPHOLSTERY OPTIONS

WE—KNIT® 003

COMPOSITION

100% Recycled PET

ABRASION RESISTANCE

100.000 Martindale
Mesh wire pulling: 4 (ISO 1–5)
Colorfastness: 5 (ISO 1–5)

LIGHT RESISTANCE

Lightfastness: 5 (ISO 1–5)

FLAME RESISTANCE

US California Tech. Bull. 117

02
OFF-WHITE

03
SAND

05
CHESTNUT

08
MUSTARD

07
CLAY

10
MOSS GREEN

13
COOL GREY

12
LIGHT BLUE

11
NAVY BLUE
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WE—KNIT® 005

COMPOSITION

70% Recycled PET + 30% Elastane

ABRASION RESISTANCE

100.000 Martindale
Mesh wire pulling: 4 (ISO 1–5)
Colorfastness: 5 (ISO 1–5)

LIGHT RESISTANCE

Lightfastness: 5 (ISO 1–5)

FLAME RESISTANCE

US California Tech. Bull. 117

02
OFF-WHITE

03
SAND

05
CHESTNUT

08
MUSTARD

07
CLAY

10
MOSS GREEN

13
COOL GREY

12
LIGHT BLUE

11
NAVY BLUE

UPHOLSTERY OPTIONS
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